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Abstract 

Co-crea1on is increasingly promoted in higher educa1on as a way to develop inclusive, 
collabora1ve prac1ces (Bovill, 2013). Yet many co-crea1on ini1a1ves remain staff-led, 
reinforcing exis1ng power hierarchies and privileging dominant norms of par1cipa1on. These 
dynamics can marginalise neurodivergent students, par1cularly when co-crea1on relies on 
verbal fluency, emo1onal reflec1on, or rapid response. This ar1cle examines a student-led co-
created project in which an au1s1c postgraduate student ini1ated and directed the redesign 
of a university’s postgraduate admissions interview. Centring lived experience, the project 
reconfigured ins1tu1onal roles, shared decision-making power and authority, and developed 
inclusive interview prac1ces now adopted on a number of postgraduate programmes. 
Drawing on principles of Universal Design for Learning (UDL) and equity-focused collabora1on, 
the project challenges assump1ons about communica1on, leadership, and inclusion. It offers 
a model of co-crea1on as a rela1onal and transforma1ve process that posi1ons 
neurodivergent knowledge not as feedback, but as leadership, and reframes inclusion as 
structural redesign rather than accommoda1on. 

 
Introduc<on 

Co-crea1on has gained increasing prominence in higher educa1on as a prac1ce that posi1ons 
students as ac1ve partners in shaping teaching, curricula, and ins1tu1onal cultures (Bovill, 
2013; Bovill et al., 2014). Rooted in the ideals of partnership, reciprocity, and shared 
responsibility, co-crea1on is oaen presented as a means to enhance student engagement, 
democra1se educa1onal processes, and improve ins1tu1onal responsiveness (Mercer-
Mapstone & Bovill, 2019).  
 
These aims reflect a hopeful vision: that through co-crea1on, students can exercise greater 
agency, bring lived experience into ins1tu1onal processes, and contribute meaningfully to 
decision-making. In prac1ce, however, the implementa1on of co-crea1on oaen falls short of 
its transforma1ve poten1al. Staff frequently retain control over the terms and scope of 
collabora1on, and projects may remain within the confines of consulta1on or curricular 
enhancement rather than challenging deeper ins1tu1onal norms (Cook-Sather et al., 2018). 
As Mercer-Mapstone and Bovill (2019) note, co-crea1on efforts can uninten1onally reproduce 
exis1ng hierarchies unless they are inten1onally and explicitly designed to redistribute power. 
A growing body of cri1que also highlights how norma1ve expecta1ons around 
communica1on, professionalism, and par1cipa1on shape who is recognised as a legi1mate 
partner in these ini1a1ves (Ahmed, 2012; Lubicz-Nawrocka, 2018). For neurodivergent 
students, including those who are au1s1c, dyslexic, or have Agen1on Deficit Hyperac1vity 
Disorder (ADHD), these expecta1ons may conflict with their preferred ways of expressing 
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ideas or engaging with ins1tu1ons (Crompton et al., 2020b; Desaunay et al., 2020; Howard & 
Sedgewick, 2021). When co-crea1on assumes fluent speech, quick thinking, and ease with 
emo1onal self-disclosure, it risks excluding those whose strengths lie elsewhere. Even well-
inten1oned projects can thus reinforce barriers, despite aiming for inclusion. 
 
This ar1cle contributes to a call to reframe co-crea1on not simply as partnership, but as a 
process of power redistribu1on. While this principle applies broadly, its urgency is par1cularly 
relevant in the context of au1sm. For au1s1c students, assump1ons about communica1on, 
confidence, and par1cipa1on oaen create invisible barriers to recogni1on and leadership 
(Milton, 2012; Winstone & Carless, 2019). Shiaing power, in this context, means enabling 
students to define both the purpose and method of collabora1on, rather than asking them to 
adapt to pre-set agendas (Bovill, 2013). It builds on cri1ques that highlight how structural 
inequali1es can persist within co-crea1on unless efforts are deliberately structured to 
redistribute authority, not merely share tasks (Cook-Sather et al., 2018; Mercer-Mapstone & 
Bovill, 2019). 
 
The project discussed in this ar1cle offers one such example. Staff began by asking the student 
what magered most to them and what they would like to lead. In response, an au1s1c 
postgraduate student defined the focus for change and led the work from incep1on, invi1ng 
staff to collaborate. Supported through a ChangeMakers programme (University College 
London, n.d.), the project sought to redesign postgraduate intake interviews to make them 
more inclusive of neurodivergent applicants. Rather than func1oning as a staff-led 
consulta1on, the process was rooted in lived experience and student leadership, challenging 
dominant assump1ons about who defines value, poten1al, and ins1tu1onal belonging. This 
approach resonates with Neary and Winn’s (2009) student as producer model, which 
reimagines students not as consumers of educa1on but as co-creators of knowledge and 
ins1tu1onal meaning. It challenges the passive framing of student experience and calls for 
structural par1cipa1on in academic and ins1tu1onal produc1on. 
 
While aligning with broader co-crea1on literature, the project reimagines its core premises. It 
challenges the view that staff must ini1ate, define, or guide collabora1on and instead 
proposes an approach grounded in recognising lived experience as a form of knowledge and 
in meaningful ins1tu1onal change. This ar1cle begins by reviewing literature on co-crea1on 
and partnership, then situates the project in its ins1tu1onal context, outlines its development, 
and reflects on what it means to centre neurodivergent authorship in inclusive prac1ce. 
Through this case, this ar1cle explores how co-crea1on, when led by au1s1c students, can 
evolve into a rela1onal and power-conscious prac1ce that challenges neurotypical 
assump1ons and informs broader ins1tu1onal norms around inclusion and equity. As 
Dollinger et al. (2018) argue, transforma1on occurs when students par1cipate in shaping the 
very systems that shape them. This project exemplifies that shia from inclusion to ins1tu1onal 
redesign. 
 

Reframing Co-Crea<on: Models, Assump<ons, and Challenges 

Co-crea1on has been widely adopted in higher educa1on as a response to the limita1ons of 
tradi1onal student engagement approaches. Typically defined as a collabora1ve process 
where students and staff work together to shape learning and ins1tu1onal prac1ces (Bovill, 
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2013; Healey et al., 2014), co-crea1on offers more inclusive, reciprocal rela1onships than 
consulta1on or feedback-led models. 
 
However, co-crea1on is not inherently equitable. Many ini1a1ves retain exis1ng hierarchies, 
with staff determining goals, 1melines, and outcomes. As Kahu (2013) notes, student 
engagement is a complex and contested concept, shaped by ins1tu1onal assump1ons about 
what par1cipa1on looks like and how it should be measured. Co-crea1on is oaen proposed as 
a more rela1onal alterna1ve, but it too can fall short unless underlying power dynamics are 
addressed. Students may be invited into processes already defined, leaving ligle scope for 
shared authorship or structural change (Bovill et al., 2014; Mercer-Mapstone & Bovill, 2019). 
Bovill et al. (2016) emphasise that meaningful co-crea1on must involve students from the 
outset, not merely at the point of implementa1on. Without this, co-crea1on may replicate 
exis1ng hierarchies under the language of partnership (Cook-Sather, 2018). 
 
These concerns are especially pressing in the context of au1sm. Common co-crea1on formats, 
oaen experienced by au1s1c students as fast-paced mee1ngs, open verbal discussion, or 
emo1onally framed reflec1on, tend to reflect neurotypical communica1on preferences 
(Ballan1ne et al., 2023; Crompton et al., 2020a). When staff define not only the content but 
also the format and process of collabora1on, au1s1c students may not just be excluded, they 
may be silenced. Modes of engagement that rely on spontaneous speech or social fluency can 
prevent au1s1c students from expressing their ideas or being recognised as legi1mate 
contributors, even when present. 
 
These dynamics also affect other neurodivergent students, such as those with ADHD, dyslexia, 
or sensory processing differences, whose communica1on strengths may not align with 
conven1onal models of par1cipa1on. While the specific barriers vary, the underlying problem 
remains: co-crea1on oaen privileges certain ways of engaging and devalues others, unless its 
structures are consciously reimagined.  
 
The project discussed in this ar1cle responds to these dynamics by rethinking co-crea1on as 
more than collabora1on: as a way to redistribute power, challenge dominant assump1ons, 
and redesign the condi1ons under which par1cipa1on occurs. It shias the focus from invi1ng 
student feedback to sharing authorship and shaping ins1tu1onal change. 
 
Origina1ng from the lived experience of an au1s1c postgraduate student, this project was not 
a response to a staff-led ini1a1ve, but a student-led challenge to exis1ng ins1tu1onal prac1ce. 
Through a ChangeMakers programme (University College London, n.d.), the redesign of the 
postgraduate intake interview was ini1ated by a student following an invita1on from staff to 
lead the work. This staff recep1veness enabled the student to guide the research focus and 
lead collabora1on on inclusive alterna1ves. 
 
This approach to co-crea1on, in which staff acted as scaffolders rather than directors, aligns 
with Bovill et al.’s (2014) emphasis on the transforma1ve poten1al of partnership - a reshaping 
of rela1onships, roles, and ins1tu1onal prac1ces. It challenges dominant assump1ons about 
who sets the agenda, whose knowledge counts, and what ins1tu1onal inclusion requires. 
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Moving from Par4cipa4on to Shared Responsibility 

Co-crea1on has been promoted as a way to move beyond engagement-as-consulta1on, 
offering students a more ac1ve role in shaping higher educa1on (Healey et al., 2014). Yet most 
co-crea1on efforts s1ll operate within staff-led frameworks, where student involvement is 
limited to contribu1ng ideas, not shaping direc1on (Mercer-Mapstone & Bovill, 2019). As 
Cook-Sather (2018) points out, without a shia in authority, such ini1a1ves risk reproducing 
symbolic forms of partnership. 
 
Assump1ons about what “good” par1cipa1on looks like (quick responses, verbal fluency, 
emo1onal reflec1on) can marginalise those who engage differently (Ballan1ne et al., 2023; 
Howard & Sedgewick, 2021). When neurodivergent students are not involved in designing 
par1cipa1on itself, co-crea1on risks excluding the very perspec1ves it claims to centre. 
 
Some projects have begun to adopt more flexible and strengths-based methods. White et al. 
(2023), for instance, advocate for mul1modal par1cipa1on using visual tools, wrigen 
contribu1ons, and asynchronous collabora1on to widen access. But as Cook-Sather et al. 
(2018) argue, accessibility must be paired with equity. The key ques1on is not only who is 
included, but who sets the terms. 
 
Projects such as Au4sm&Uni (Fabri et al., 2016) and Naviga4ng University (Brownlow et al., 
2023), while expanding representa1on, oaen remain within staff-defined parameters. They 
offer valuable resources but may not challenge how ins1tu1ons conceptualise leadership, 
communica1on, or capacity for change. 
 
In contrast, the project at the heart of this ar1cle reversed these dynamics. The au1s1c 
student did not join a pre-exis1ng ini1a1ve; she ini1ated the work, defined its focus, and led 
its direc1on. Staff were invited in as collaborators, suppor1ng rather than steering. This shia 
exemplifies equity-conscious partnership (Mercer-Mapstone & Bovill, 2019), where 
redistribu1on of power, not just of responsibili1es, becomes the founda1on for co-crea1on. 
 
Au4s4c Student-Led Co-Crea4on 

When co-crea1on begins with lived experience, par1cularly from students historically 
marginalised in higher educa1on, it opens new possibili1es for ins1tu1onal cri1que and 
transforma1on. Au1s1c-led co-crea1on does not ask how students can adapt to exis1ng 
systems, but what needs to change.  Lived experience becomes not an add-on, but a source 
of ins1tu1onal knowledge and leadership (Nind, 2014; Bovill et al., 2014). 
 
This approach unsegles dominant models. Many Students as Partners (SaP) ini1a1ves, even 
when framed as partnership, retain staff control over process, pace, and communica1on style. 
As Mercer-Mapstone & Bovill (2019) note, equity in co-crea1on requires agen1on not only to 
who par1cipates, but to how par1cipa1on is structured. 
 
Au1s1c-led co-crea1on brings these assump1ons into focus. Milton’s (2012) ‘Double Empathy 
Problem’ reminds us that communica1on challenges between au1s1c and non-au1s1c people 
are rela1onal, not one-sided. Inclusion, then, requires ins1tu1ons to adapt, not just students. 
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Equity is achieved not by offering access to pre-defined processes, but by reimagining those 
processes from the ground up. 
 
This project exemplifies this approach through an au1s1c student’s leadership in redesigning 
postgraduate interviews. The au1s1c student iden1fied a structural problem (the design of 
postgraduate interviews) and led a collabora1ve redesign grounded in neurodivergent 
experience. Staff supported the work rela1onally and prac1cally, without overriding the 
student’s leadership. 
 
This is co-crea1on not as inclusion into exis1ng systems, but as a challenge to them.  As Bovill 
et al. (2016) argue, genuine co-crea1on builds new systems in partnership rather than simply 
accommoda1ng students within old ones. 
 

Project background and founda<ons 

Iden4fying the problem: Interview barriers and neurodivergent experience 

The project began when an au1s1c postgraduate student found that the university’s intake 
interview process was poorly aligned with her strengths. The student lead was a mature home 
student with a rela1vely recent formal au1sm diagnosis, drawing on both personal and 
paren1ng experiences of neurodivergence. The interview format relied heavily on 
spontaneous verbal responses, confident self-presenta1on, and emo1onally framed 
ques1ons. These features made the experience par1cularly challenging.  In conversa1ons with 
other students and through her work with the Student–Staff Equity, Diversity and Inclusion 
(SSEDI) group, she realised that many neurodivergent students, including those with ADHD or 
sensory sensi1vi1es had faced similar barriers. 
 
The student wanted to understand how differences in communica1on style, sensory 
experience, and thinking processes affect students’ ability to take part in interviews.  Drawing 
on her own experience and insights from earlier ChangeMakers (University College London, 
n.d.) and SSEDI work, she proposed a collabora1ve redesign of the interview process. With 
staff support, the team explored how tradi1onal interview prac1ces might uninten1onally 
exclude students whose communica1on styles differ from ins1tu1onal expecta1ons. 
 
The project adopted a strengths-based approach, moving away from assump1ons that verbal 
fluency or confidence are indicators of ability (White et al., 2023). Instead, it raised broader 
ques1ons about how fairness is defined in admissions and how ins1tu1ons can recognise 
poten1al through a wider range of quali1es and ways of communica1ng. Kahu and Nelson 
(2017) argue that student success depends not only on individual agributes but on the 
alignment between ins1tu1onal environments and students’ ways of engaging. The interview 
redesign sought to improve this alignment by reducing cogni1ve load and affirming diverse 
communica1on styles. These concerns are reflected in wider research on employment 
interviews.  Norris et al. (2020), for example, found that au1s1c candidates were oaen judged 
nega1vely because of how they communicated. Reduced eye contact and longer response 
1mes led to lower ra1ngs, even when answers were accurate and thoughqul. Their findings 
suggest that judgments are oaen shaped not only by content but by delivery style. The project 
therefore adds to a growing body of evidence (e.g. Maras et al., 2021; Norris et al., 2020) that 
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urges ins1tu1ons to cri1cally examine how unspoken norms around communica1on shape 
outcomes and to consider more carefully who is enabled to succeed and who is disadvantaged 
by exis1ng prac1ces. 
 
Rethinking inclusion as systemic change 

While the project began with the specific barriers faced by au1s1c and neurodivergent 
students, its implica1ons extend to broader ques1ons of how ins1tu1onal systems approach 
inclusion. In the UK, Equity, Diversity and Inclusion (EDI) strategies are oaen shaped by legal 
obliga1ons under the Equality Act 2010 which requires ins1tu1ons to provide reasonable 
adjustments for disabled students (Equality Act, 2010). In prac1ce, however, this oaen results 
in support being offered only aaer a student discloses a need (Hockings, 2010). As a 
consequence, accessibility is treated as an addi1onal layer rather than a fundamental part of 
the system. 
 
The interview process reflected this reac1ve approach. It assumed all applicants could 
perform well without prepara1on. Ques1ons were not shared in advance, and many were 
framed in emo1onally loaded ways, for example “Tell us about a 1me you overcame 
adversity.” These types of ques1ons rely on unspoken social expecta1ons and require 
candidates to produce fluent and confident responses in a high-pressure environment. For 
many neurodivergent students, this creates addi1onal anxiety and reduces their ability to 
perform at their best (Desaunay et al., 2020; Maras et al., 2021). 
 
Students were also expected to iden1fy their own needs and request adjustments, oaen 
without clear informa1on about what support was available. This placed the responsibility for 
inclusion on the individual. Drawing on the work of Rosqvist, Chown and Stenning (2020), the 
project challenged the assump1on that these expecta1ons are neutral. Instead, they reflect 
dominant cultural norms that systema1cally disadvantage those who do not conform. Building 
on Hockings (2010), the project shiaed the focus from requiring students to adapt, to 
rethinking the design of the interview process itself. 
 
Rethinking inclusion aGer the pandemic  

Although this project did not directly respond to the COVID-19 pandemic, it took place during 
a period when ins1tu1ons were re-evalua1ng many of their established prac1ces. The shia to 
remote learning significantly altered the way teaching, communica1on, and par1cipa1on 
were structured (Koh & Daniel, 2022). For neurodivergent students, this moment exposed 
long-standing challenges while also highligh1ng new possibili1es for more flexible and 
responsive approaches (Madaus et al., 2022). 
 
As Ballan1ne et al. (2023) observe, the pandemic unsegled tradi1onal expecta1ons about 
what engagement should look like. Au1s1c students reported mixed experiences. Some 
benefiged from reduced sensory demands and greater control over communica1on. Others 
found the lack of rou1ne, inconsistent expecta1ons, and reduced informal support more 
difficult. These contras1ng outcomes reinforced the need for systems that an1cipate a range 
of needs, rather than relying on individual requests for support aaer difficul1es arise 
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This broader context shaped how the project was understood and supported. The 
postgraduate interview process it sought to revise rested on assump1ons that had rarely been 
ques1oned, such as the value placed on quick responses and confident self-presenta1on. The 
disrup1on caused by the pandemic created space to revisit these norms and to consider how 
inclusion might be more meaningfully embedded in ins1tu1onal processes. Rather than 
trea1ng the pandemic as a temporary interrup1on, the project used it as a prompt to 
reimagine how engagement could be supported more comprehensively.  
 
Crucially, this rethinking of engagement was not only conceptual but prac1cal. The project 
translated its cri1que of dominant norms into a collabora1ve method of working that 
redefined how roles, responsibili1es, and decision-making were shared. 
 
A rela4onal approach 

The project provides a concrete example of how ins1tu1onal change can be led by students. 
Rather than trea1ng students as sources of feedback or their experiences as supplementary 
data, it placed the au1s1c student lead’s perspec1ve at the centre of both the project’s 
purpose and its method. The collabora1on moved away from formal hierarchies and 
predefined roles. Staff and the au1s1c student worked together through shared planning and 
flexible approaches, adap1ng responsibili1es as the project progressed. This way of working 
showed that inclusion is not only about outcomes, but also about how decisions are made 
and whose contribu1ons are valued throughout the process (Nind, 2014).  By recognising lived 
experience as a valid founda1on for informing ins1tu1onal prac1ce, and by ac1vely sharing 
responsibility, the project demonstrated that engagement can func1on as a collabora1ve 
process grounded in trust and guided by deliberate agen1on to power and decision-making 
authority. 

Co-crea<on in prac<ce: Redesigning the interview process 

This sec1on describes how the co-crea1on process developed from the ini1al iden1fica1on of 
the problem to collabora1ve implementa1on. It focuses on the project’s dis1nc1ve features 
(par1cularly its inversion of typical staff–student dynamics) and demonstrates how power was 
consciously shared to support student leadership. 
 
Challenging tradi4onal co-crea4on norms 

The project began with a proposal from an au1s1c postgraduate student through a 
ChangeMakers programme (University College London, n.d.).  Drawing on her own experience 
of the intake interview and on conversa1ons with neurodivergent peers, she iden1fied specific 
structural barriers embedded in the interview format. These included the demand for quick 
verbal responses, emo1onally framed prompts, and implicit expecta1ons around confident 
self-presenta1on. While these features might seem neutral, they reflect norma1ve 
assump1ons about communica1on, cogni1on, and performance that can disadvantage 
neurodivergent applicants (Desaunay et al., 2020; Maras et al., 2021).  
 
Importantly, the student did not enter a pre-defined partnership project. She defined the 
problem space, set the scope of the work, and led the forma1on of the team. Staff were 
invited to join the process only aaer the core focus had been determined. This represents a 
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reversal of most SaP dynamics, where staff ini1ate the work and then seek student 
involvement (Bovill et al., 2016; Cook-Sather, 2018). The student’s observa1on that “this is 
engagement that emerges from the student, not invited by the ins1tu1on” marked a 
deliberate shia toward student-led change. 
 
This aligns with Mercer-Mapstone & Bovill’s (2019) equity-focused co-crea1on model, which 
emphasises leadership by those most affected by exclusion. By centring the au1s1c student’s 
experien1al knowledge and enabling her to define the agenda, the project broke from 
tokenis1c consulta1on models and created space for ins1tu1onal learning grounded in lived 
exper1se. 
 
Scaffolded autonomy and rela4onal collabora4on 

Once the project was underway, staff took on responsive roles designed to support rather 
than steer. They assisted with administra1ve tasks such as ethics approval and documenta1on, 
but also adapted their communica1on styles and planning tools to meet the student lead’s 
preferences. For example, they used visual 1melines and scheduled regular mee1ngs to 
reduce execu1ve func1oning load and maintain momentum without overwhelming pressure 
(Brown, 2006). 
 
This working style reflects key principles of “scaffolded autonomy” in trauma-informed 
educa1on (Perry and Daniels, 2016) where autonomy and support are not treated as 
opposites but as interdependent. As Brake et al. (2024) note, inflexible systems can increase 
stress and reduce par1cipa1on. Staff recognised that enabling leadership some1mes required 
stepping back and some1mes required stepping in. This fluid, rela1onal model of 
collabora1on aligns with Bovill et al.’s (2014) call for co-crea1on processes to be con1nually 
re-nego1ated in light of power, context, and capacity. 
 
Crucially, staff did not treat accessibility strategies as supplementary accommoda1ons. 
Instead, these prac1ces were embedded into the core design of the project. This reflects 
Universal Design for Learning (UDL) (CAST, 2018) which advocates for inclusive structures that 
an1cipate diverse needs rather than retrofisng support aaer barriers arise. The project thus 
became an experiment in modelling inclusive prac1ce through its own methods of working, 
not only its outcomes. 
 
Co-crea4ng knowledge: Survey design and analysis 

To inform the redesign of the interview process, the team developed a survey to explore 
students’ experiences of postgraduate interviews. Rather than staff designing the research 
tool and invi1ng student input, the survey was co-created from the outset. The au1s1c 
student lead played a central role in shaping the ques1ons, structure, and language, ensuring 
the tool reflected neurodivergent priori1es. This approach exemplifies Bovill’s (2016) model 
of early-stage partnership, where students are involved in defining not only content but also 
methodology.  
 
The survey included both scaled and open-ended ques1ons, with a focus on five areas 
iden1fied through the student lead’s reflec1ons and relevant literature related to memory 
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recall (Desaunay et al., 2020; Gaigg et al., 2008), emo1onal reasoning (Crompton et al., 
2020a), interview communica1on barriers (Norris & Maras, 2022), and sensory issues 
(MacLellan et al., 2022).  Rather than framing these as deficits, the survey adopted a strengths-
based perspec1ve (White et al., 2023), asking students how they process informa1on and 
what supports their ability to communicate effec1vely.  One student described the challenge 
as follows: “I have to think of events and then feelings if that makes sense… slower to answer, 
difficult pinning down a memory of an emo4on before working out if it's relevant to the 
ques4on.” This response exemplifies how emo1onally framed ques1ons can create addi1onal 
cogni1ve load, not because of a lack of insight, but because of how memory and emo1on are 
processed differently (Crompton et al., 2020a; Desaunay et al., 2020; Gaigg et al., 2008). It 
highlights the importance of allowing 1me, clarity, and alterna1ve formats to access students’ 
full capaci1es.  
 
This design choice reflects principles of UDL (CAST, 2018) which priori1se flexible formats and 
mul1ple modes of expression. It also challenges tradi1onal research hierarchies, posi1oning 
the au1s1c student not as a respondent or assistant, but as a co-creator of ins1tu1onal 
knowledge.  
 
Shared authority in data interpreta4on 

The analysis phase con1nued this commitment to power-sharing. The team used a structured 
qualita1ve approach (open, axial, and selec1ve coding) to examine over sixty themes related 
to communica1on, stress, masking, and sensory experiences. Throughout this process, the 
au1s1c student lead co-developed the coding framework, shaped the narra1ve structure, and 
influenced which themes were priori1sed for ins1tu1onal ac1on. 
 
This level of involvement goes beyond consulta1on. As Cook-Sather (2018) emphasises, 
partnership must include shared epistemic authority: deciding what counts as evidence, how 
findings are interpreted, and what meanings are drawn. In this project, for example, 
behaviours like pausing before answering or avoiding eye contact were not treated as signs of 
disengagement, but understood as valid and typical responses within certain neurotypes. This 
marks an interpre1ve shia grounded in the student lead’s lived experience. 
 
The team also gave par1cular agen1on to the theme of masking: the oaen-invisible labour 
neurodivergent students perform to appear more “typical” in high-pressure sesngs that do 
not accommodate their needs (Miller et al., 2021). The student lead iden1fied this as a central 
issue and insisted it be treated not just as an individual coping mechanism but as an 
ins1tu1onal equity concern. The analysis made clear that masking is not simply a short-term 
strategy for fisng in. It carries a significant emo1onal and cogni1ve cost, oaen resul1ng in 
exhaus1on, reduced performance, and long-term impacts on wellbeing (Bargiela et al., 2016; 
Livingston et al., 2019). By foregrounding this issue, the au1s1c student lead helped the team 
recognise that interview condi1ons which reward masking are not only inequitable but also 
ethically problema1c. 
 
The analysis thus posi1oned masking not as an individual trait but as a response to structural 
exclusion - an interpreta1on that may not have surfaced without the leadership of someone 
with lived au1s1c experience.  
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Quan4ta4ve alignment and par4cipatory synthesis 

The survey’s quan1ta1ve data, including descrip1ve sta1s1cs (e.g. frequency counts and 
percentage preferences) and correla1ons, reinforced the qualita1ve findings. Adapta1ons 
such as advance access to ques1ons, wrigen response op1ons, and interviewer training were 
strongly preferred by both neurodivergent and neurotypical respondents. These preferences 
aligned with the inclusive strategies proposed in the project and supported the case for 
ins1tu1onal change. 
 
What made this analysis dis1nc1ve was not only its content, but its process. The student lead 
helped decide how findings were synthesised and presented to staff. Her leadership shaped 
not only the themes chosen, but the ethical framing of their implica1ons. This aligns with 
Nind’s (2014) model of inclusive research, where those most affected are posi1oned as co-
analysts and co-authors of change. 
 
From data to prac4ce: Co-crea4ng ins4tu4onal change 

The final phase of the project focused on transla1ng research findings into ins1tu1onal 
prac1ce. This was not treated as a dissemina1on exercise, but as a con1nua1on of co-crea1on 
by extending shared authorship into implementa1on. The au1s1c student lead and staff 
partners jointly designed and facilitated a workshop for fiaeen members of the university’s 
Postgraduate Studies staff team, including Programme Directors and interview leads. 
 
The session opened with a presenta1on of the survey findings delivered by the student lead 
who also shared personal reflec1ons on her interview experience. These insights grounded 
the subsequent collabora1ve discussions in which staff explored prac1cal adapta1ons and 
considered how ins1tu1onal norms could be reimagined. The facilita1on model reflected 
scaffolded autonomy: while the student lead guided the session’s content and framing, staff 
co-facilitated to manage logis1cal demands and create space for rela1onal safety. This 
collabora1ve format ensured that leadership was centred on lived exper1se without placing 
unsustainable pressure on the student. 
 
Staff contribu1ons were audio-recorded, transcribed, and thema1cally analysed - again 
through a collabora1ve process. Staff reflec1ons on language, feasibility, and equity were 
incorporated into a co-authored guidance leaflet now in use across relevant departments. 
Crucially, the leaflet does not posi1on adapta1ons as op1onal or compensatory. Instead, it 
frames them as examples of inclusive design: these are prac1ces that benefit all candidates, 
align with UDL (CAST, 2018) and challenge narrow defini1ons of performance. 
  
The leaflet’s core recommenda1ons include: 

• Share interview ques1ons in advance; 
• Clarify emo1onal language in prompts; 
• Allow wrigen responses or notes during interview; 
• Make structure and expecta1ons explicit; 
• Provide breaks and reduce sensory stressors where possible. 
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These are not simply procedural 1ps; they reflect a broader shia in how the ins1tu1on 
understands fairness, communica1on, and poten1al. As one staff member reflected: “What 
does student-led mean? It means the student’s voice is centred, but it also means we take 
joint responsibility, that the onus of the labour or work does not fall to the student .”  
 
Addi1onal reflec1ons from staff agending the workshop highlighted the deeper ins1tu1onal 
impact of this collabora1ve approach. One par1cipant shared, “Thank you so much for all the 
work you've put into this, it has given me a lot to think about... it has shown me the things 
that I don't do, that didn't occur for me to do.” Another noted, “[The session] has been really 
eye-opening... I can see now how the way we work may disadvantage people who are 
neurodivergent... it's making me think now about teaching and how some of the prac4cal 4ps 
you've men4oned could be applied there also.” A third reflected, “It's been really helpful to 
have prac4cal things I could take forward and share with my team.” 
 
These comments reflect not only an increase in awareness but a willingness to engage in 
structural reflec1on and change. By posi1oning the student as the lead in both research and 
facilita1on, the project modelled co-crea1on as a method of ins1tu1onal learning and 
responsiveness. This ethos captures the project’s central contribu1on: a redefini1on of co-
crea1on as a rela1onal, power-conscious approach that treats students’ experiences as a 
legi1mate basis for change. 
 
Discussion 
 
The project began with a focused aim: to address a specific barrier in the university’s 
admissions process that excluded some neurodivergent applicants. Its implica1ons, however, 
reach beyond the redesign of a single interview format. The project invites a wider 
examina1on of how co-crea1on is typically approached in higher educa1on: who sets the 
terms, who holds authority, and what inclusion looks like in prac1ce. This sec1on explores 
how the project challenged prevailing assump1ons about leadership, exper1se, and 
ins1tu1onal roles through a student-led, collabora1ve model. 
 
From involvement to leadership and shared authority 

In many universi1es, co-crea1on ini1a1ves remain constrained by ins1tu1onal norms. 
Students are oaen invited to contribute to staff-led processes with limited influence over the 
agenda or scope of change. Projects are typically framed around improving exis1ng structures 
rather than rethinking them. Na1onal policy frameworks such as the Na1onal Student Survey 
(NSS) and the Teaching Excellence Framework (TEF), while not co-crea1on ini1a1ves 
themselves, have reinforced models in which students are posi1oned as respondents rather 
than as co-authors of ins1tu1onal prac1ce (Trowler, 2010; Darwin, 2021). Kandiko Howson 
and Matos (2021) note that na1onal surveys like the NSS oaen conflate sa1sfac1on with 
engagement, reducing students' roles to that of evaluators rather than collaborators in 
ins1tu1onal development. As Langan and Harris (2019) argue, the NSS incen1vises surface-
level improvements aligned with sa1sfac1on metrics, leaving limited room for deeper, 
student-led transforma1ons. 
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This project took a different approach. The au1s1c student lead did not respond to an exis1ng 
agenda. She defined the issue, proposed changes, and led the redesign. Staff supported her 
by adap1ng their roles, providing strategic scaffolding, and sharing decision-making authority. 
This was not symbolic involvement. It was a deliberate and shared process of redistribu1ng 
power, leadership and co-authoring change. 
 
The structure of collabora1on was key. As Healey et al. (2014) and Bovill et al. (2016) argue, 
co-crea1on needs to be inten1onally structured to build genuine partnership. Staff ac1vely 
adjusted 1melines, expecta1ons, and responsibili1es to enable leadership by the student. 
These adjustments were not incidental but central to crea1ng a collabora1ve environment. 
This shia aligns with Mercer-Mapstone & Bovill’s (2019) call for equity-focused co-crea1on in 
which authority and epistemic recogni1on are shared with those most impacted by exclusion. 
To clarify this dis1nc1on, Table 1, below, summarises the key differences between dominant 
co-crea1on models and the approach developed in this project. 

Tradi<onal Co-Crea<on This Project’s Approach 

Staff ini1ate the project and define the focus Student ini1ates the project and defines the agenda 

Students respond to staff-designed processes Staff respond to student leadership with adap1ve 
support 

Lived experience is used as feedback Lived experience is posi1oned as epistemic authority 

Verbal fluency and emo1onal reflec1on are 
assumed norms 

Mul1modal, flexible formats accommodate diverse 
processing styles 

Par1cipa1on shaped by exis1ng ins1tu1onal 
norms 

Ins1tu1onal norms are challenged and reconfigured 

Inclusion means individual adjustments on 
request 

Inclusion is built into the structure from the outset 
(UDL) 

Co-crea1on occurs late in the process (e.g. 
implementa1on) 

Co-crea1on begins at agenda-sesng and con1nues 
through implementa1on 

Focus on improving exis1ng systems Focus on reimagining systems through lived experience 
and equity 

Table 1. Redefining Co-Crea4on: From Tradi4onal Models to Au4s4c-Led Prac4ce 

 
This shia not only reconfigures roles but redefines the nature of inclusion itself. 

 
Lived experience as a way of knowing 

Building on this founda1on, the project moved beyond embedding lived experience in 
leadership dynamics to posi1oning it as a primary epistemic resource. The student lead co-
shaped the research ques1ons, led the thema1c analysis, and par1cipated in decisions about 
how findings were communicated. This reflects Nind’s (2014) model of inclusive research, 
where those with lived experience help define both what is studied and how. 
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Milton’s (2012) ‘Double Empathy Problem’ also shaped the project’s framing. Rather than 
viewing communica1on challenges as individual shortcomings, it highlighted how ins1tu1onal 
prac1ces create barriers. Fast-paced interviews, emo1onally framed ques1ons, and pressure 
to respond quickly were iden1fied as prac1ces that misaligned with how some students 
process and express informa1on. 
 
Survey responses and staff reflec1ons confirmed this misalignment. Au1s1c candidates were 
oaen disadvantaged not only by how their responses were evaluated, but also by difficulty 
recalling personal informa1on under pressure. These challenges could obscure ability, even 
when relevant knowledge or experience was present. Verbal fluency, speed, and emo1onal 
expressiveness were oaen assumed to indicate capability, even though they do not represent 
the full range of ways poten1al can be demonstrated. These expecta1ons were not neutral 
and they were systemic. 
 
The findings challenged assump1ons about communica1on and ability, raising broader 
ques1ons about how inclusion is conceptualised and opera1onalised, especially in processes 
like admissions interviews, where unexamined norms determine who succeeds and who is 
excluded. 
 
Co-crea4on as inclusive praxis 

This project not only challenged a specific ins1tu1onal process but also the assump1ons 
underpinning much of the co-crea1on literature. Despite growing interest in SaP models, 
many co-crea1on ini1a1ves remain limited by staff-defined structures, narrow defini1ons of 
par1cipa1on, and insufficient agen1on to power (Mercer-Mapstone & Bovill, 2019; Cook-
Sather et al., 2018). Inclusion, in these cases, oaen means invi1ng students into exis1ng 
systems rather than transforming those systems to recognise a wider range of communica1on 
styles and cogni1ve approaches. Schmig (2019) argues for a rela1onal concept of inclusion 
that moves beyond individual adapta1on to examine how ins1tu1onal structures and 
rela1onships shape who can par1cipate, contribute, and lead. From this perspec1ve, inclusion 
requires not only access but a redistribu1on of recogni1on and influence within the system.  
 
The approach taken here suggests a different model: one in which co-crea1on is explicitly 
designed for ins1tu1onal transforma1on. This requires more than enabling par1cipa1on, it 
involves sharing epistemic authority and structural control. Bovill et al. (2016) emphasise that 
partnership is most meaningful when students shape not only content but also purpose and 
framing. This project demonstrates that principle: the student lead defined the agenda, 
shaped the analysis, and co-authored the ins1tu1onal response. 
 
The model also draws from Universal Design for Learning (CAST, 2018), which advocates for 
proac1ve, flexible design that an1cipates variability. By embedding inclusive prac1ces into the 
co-crea1on process through scaffolded collabora1on, flexible 1melines, and mul1modal 
communica1on, the project demonstrated how change can be driven by neurodivergent 
leadership. 
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Ques1ons about fairness surfaced repeatedly in the staff workshop, par1cularly whether 
adapta1ons such as sharing ques1ons in advance or allowing notes offered unfair advantage. 
This reflects a common misconcep1on: that equal treatment is the same as equitable 
treatment (CAST, 2018). In prac1ce, offering all candidates the same format can systema1cally 
disadvantage those whose needs differ. 
 
The project showed that standard interviews, especially those reliant on spontaneous speech, 
emo1onal interpreta1on, and confident presenta1on, can create barriers for neurodivergent 
applicants. These formats are not universal; they reflect assump1ons about what ability looks 
like (Crabtree et al., 2021; Maras et al., 2021). For example, slower speech or reduced eye 
contact may be misread as lack of prepara1on, even when responses are thoughqul and 
accurate. 
 
Equity means enabling candidates to demonstrate capability in different ways. Advance access 
to ques1ons, the op1on to use notes, and interviewer training do not lower standards. They 
reduce unnecessary stress and support more effec1ve communica1on. These adapta1ons 
benefit a wide range of candidates: structured ques1ons support clarity; notes reduce anxiety; 
accessible language supports linguis1c and cultural diversity (Maras et al., 2021; Norris & 
Maras, 2022). 
 
Co-crea1on, in this context, is not a method but a reconfigura1on of ins1tu1onal 
rela1onships. It centres lived experience as leadership, not tes1mony. It treats inclusion not 
as accommoda1on, but as structural redesign. It asks ins1tu1ons not simply to listen to 
students, but to be shaped by them. 
 

Implica<ons for prac<ce and policy 

 
Building on the collabora1ve approach developed through this work, this sec1on highlights 
how inclusive, student-led co-crea1on can shia not just outcomes, but the processes and 
power structures that shape them. 
 
Redefining staff–student collabora4on 

Tradi1onal models of co-crea1on oaen retain staff control over 1melines, goals, and methods. 
Students may be invited to contribute but remain constrained by ins1tu1onal frames (Cook-
Sather, 2018; Mercer-Mapstone & Bovill, 2019). Although ini1a1ves like SaP (Healey et al., 
2014) have created more opportuni1es for collabora1on, decision-making power oaen 
remains with staff. 
 
This project demonstrates that authen1c co-crea1on requires an inten1onal redistribu1on of 
power. The student lead shaped the agenda, set priori1es, and guided ins1tu1onal cri1que. 
Staff adapted their roles, ac1ng as scaffolders rather than facilitators, responding to the 
student’s leadership style and communica1on needs. Such role redefini1on does not diminish 
staff exper1se. It reframes it as rela1onal and context-sensi1ve and aligns with Bovill’s (2016) 
call for staff to create enabling structures without overdetermining them. This requires staff 
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development that includes not only partnership theory, but reflec1on on power, 
neurodivergence, and rela1onal dynamics. 
 
Building scaffolded autonomy through inclusive design 

The collabora1on model used in this project illustrates the value of scaffolded autonomy: 
structured flexibility that supports, rather than replaces, student leadership. Regular planning 
mee1ngs, flexible 1melines, visual tools, and shared task management enabled the student 
lead to direct the project while being supported in ways that reduced cogni1ve and emo1onal 
load. 
 
These strategies were not retrofiged accommoda1ons; they were integral to the project’s 
success. As UDL (CAST, 2018) suggests, inclusion is most effec1ve when it is embedded from 
the start rather than added in response to barriers. This approach can inform a wide range of 
student-staff collabora1ons, especially where students face barriers related to execu1ve 
func1oning, sensory environments, or communica1on processing. 
 
Recognising lived experience as leadership 

The project invites a rethinking of how leadership is recognised and supported. Leadership is 
oaen coded through visibility, confidence, and verbal fluency (Winstone & Carless, 2019), 
norms that may marginalise neurodivergent students. The student lead exercised leadership 
through lived knowledge, structural cri1que, agenda-sesng, and collabora1ve decision-
making. Her role was not to speak for others, but to reframe the condi1ons under which 
ins1tu1onal knowledge is created. 
 
Recognising lived experience as leadership requires rethinking what counts as exper1se. As 
Bovill et al. (2014) argue, students are not only ’knowers’ of their experiences but poten1al 
re-designers of systems. Staff must therefore move beyond symbolic inclusion and support 
the development of inclusive spaces, where different forms of knowing are validated and 
centred. 
 
Embedding equity into co-crea4on frameworks 

This project affirms Mercer-Mapstone & Bovill’s (2019) argument that co-crea1on must agend 
to equity, not only in who is involved, but in how structures are reshaped. Equity here means 
more than fairness in process; it involves iden1fying and addressing systemic exclusions. It 
asks whether dominant methods, assump1ons, or formats prevent certain students from 
leading or contribu1ng meaningfully. 
 
Equity-conscious co-crea1on must an1cipate the need for structural adapta1on, not rely on 
individual students to request it. Staff must develop the confidence to work flexibly, ques1on 
tradi1onal academic norms, and reflect on how power flows through co-crea1on processes. 
This includes embedding UDL principles, trauma-informed strategies, and accessible 
communica1on prac1ces as standard components of collabora1ve work. 
 
Strategies for sustainable inclusive co-crea4on 
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The following strategies are offered as prac1cal tools for inclusive co-crea1on across contexts: 

• Co-create flexible 1melines and phased planning at the project’s outset;  
• Provide wrigen agendas and visual tools (e.g. checklists, flowcharts) to support 

planning and focus; 
• Replace open-ended ques1ons with specific prompts to reduce cogni1ve ambiguity; 
• Normalise wrigen and asynchronous communica1on, including editable documents 

and messaging plaqorms; 
• An1cipate execu1ve func1oning support needs (e.g. shared scheduling, task tracking) 

without requiring disclosure; 
• Share leadership and administra1ve responsibili1es to prevent cogni1ve overload on 

student leads. 
 
These prac1ces are not exclusive to neurodivergent students. They create more sustainable, 
flexible collabora1ons for all par1cipants and shia ins1tu1onal norms toward more equitable 
models of engagement. 

 
Conclusion 

Although this project focused on one specific ins1tu1onal process (the postgraduate 
admissions interview), its implica1ons extend far beyond. It offers a working model of co-
crea1on as inclusive, student-led ins1tu1onal redesign. By centring lived experience, 
redistribu1ng power and leadership, and embedding flexibility into the collabora1ve process, 
the project reimagined not only what inclusion looks like, but how it is made possible. 
Crucially, the project did not invite neurodivergent students into a pre-exis1ng engagement 
framework. It ques1oned that framework itself in terms of its norms, assump1ons, and 
defini1ons of ability. In doing so, it responded to calls from Bovill et al. (2016), Cook-Sather 
(2018), and Mercer-Mapstone and Bovill (2019) for co-crea1on that addresses power, 
recognises diverse epistemologies, and reshapes ins1tu1onal structures rather than merely 
diversifying par1cipa1on. 
 
Grounded in scaffolded autonomy and inclusive communica1on, the collabora1ve method 
exemplified the very prac1ces it advocated. This coherence between process and outcome 
was central to the project’s legi1macy and impact. It demonstrated that inclusion is not a 
mager of consulta1on, but of co-authorship; not a mager of access, but of agency. 
 
In a 1me when higher educa1on seeks to become more inclusive, this project offers a 
transferable approach: one that challenges assump1ons, foregrounds lived knowledge, and 
builds ins1tu1onal responsiveness into both the design and delivery of change. Co-crea1on, 
when led by those most affected, becomes not just a tool for engagement but a prac1ce of 
jus1ce. 
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